
Correspondence on Persimmon Homes Development on Penny Pot 
Lane (King Edwin Park)

Response from David Mitchell, 10th October 2020

Dear Ms Sandell,

Thanks for your email of 9th October. I'm pleased to hear that the development will be required to 
comply with Cycle Infrastructure Design (CID) LTN 1/20.

I can see that some houses are already occupied, but as I understand it you're saying it's only when 
particular houses next to the Country Park are occupied that you expect to receive details of 
footpath and cycleway links.

Nevertheless, I don't need to wait for Persimmon to say what they are doing about cycling because I 
can see what is happening (and not happening) by visiting the area. 

Penny Pot Lane

I can see that there is a shared use pavement from the development east for a very short distance, as 
far as the junction with Young's Drive. The shared use section then stops, and the rest of the 
pavement on Penny Pot Lane down to Oak Beck is so narrow that it is an uncomfortable experience 
walking along it because the cars pass so closely; there is no cycle provision.

Killinghall Moor Country Park
There is a mud and gravel dog walkers' path from the end of Young's Drive, around the edge of 
Oakdale Golf Course, towards the Jennyfield area of Harrogate. This path does not meet the 
minimum standards of cycle infrastructure, in terms of the quality of the surface, the width, and the 
fact that it is shared use.

More importantly, it takes you from one peripheral housing estate to another peripheral housing 

Illustration 1: Shared use pavement on Penny Pot Lane



estate. It doesn't go to the key locations (schools, town centre shopping) that residents of King 
Edwin Park will want and need to go to. It cannot be put forward as the main cycle infrastructure 
serving the development. 

Penny Pot Lane is the road that will be used by residents for most everyday trips. The distances are 
a little too far to be walked, but could easily be cycled. Unfortunately, there is no provision for 
cycling.

Road safety
40% of new car sales are SUVs. Pickup trucks and 4x4s are a major proportion of the vehicles that 
use our roads. Studies show that pedestrians hit by SUVs at 40mph (the speed limit near the 
Persimmon development) will die in 100% of cases, against 54% when hit by normal cars.

How many parents are going to let their children cycle to school, sharing Penny Pot Lane with 
SUVs and other fast-moving vehicles? None.

Cycle Infrastructure Design (CID)
This is how I would assess the cycle infrastructure in the context of CID.

Cycling must no longer be treated as marginal or an afterthought. It must be placed at the heart 
of the transport network (Foreword, CID). Cycling has not been put at the heart of the transport 
network around this development. It is not a viable option for most people to most destinations in 
central, west and south Harrogate. This is a 99.9% car-centric development.

Routes should be Coherent (one of the Core Design Principles), and allow people to reach their 
day-to-day destinations along routes that connect and are of a consistent quality.
Penny Pot Lane: there is no infrastructure beyond Young's Drive.
Killinghall Moor: this route is shared use pavement at first, then a mud and gravel path, then 
eventually reaches Jennyfield Drive which has a cycle path (which does not meet the standards in 
the guidance – because it is shared use, and gives way to all side roads). The Killinghall Moor route 
is inconsistent and always of a quality below the minimum standards in CID.

Illustration 2: Killinghall Moor Country Park path

https://www.forbes.com/sites/jimgorzelany/2020/06/17/study-says-suvs-are-more-deadly-striking-pedestrians-than-cars/
https://oilprice.com/Latest-Energy-News/World-News/SUV-Sales-Exceed-40-Of-Global-Car-Sales-For-The-First-Time.html


Routes should be Direct (one of the Core Design Principles). They should be at least as direct as 
those for private motor vehicles. Routes involving extra distance and stopping and starting are 
likely to be ignored. The direct route to most destinations is Penny Pot Lane. The poor quality 
Killinghall Moor route is direct for a small number of destinations (Jennyfield Coop and Hydro), 
but not for most destinations. People can't be asked to cycle to the town centre on an indirect route 
via Jennyfields. They just won't do it.

Safe (Core Design Principle). Penny Pot Lane is narrow, and has twists and turns. There is a high 
volume of traffic. It is not safe for inclusive cycling.

Comfortable (Core Design Principle). Routes should be good quality with well-maintained 
surfaces and adequate width for the volume of users.
Penny Pot Lane: the width of the shared use path is 2m70, below the minimum of 3m.
Killinghall Moor: this path does not have a suitable surface for inclusive cycling and is below the 
minimum width for shared use paths. (It is about 1m wide near the end of Queen Ethelburga's Park, 
and perhaps 2m wide elsewhere).

Summary Principle 1: Cycle infrastructure should be accessible to everyone from 8 to 80 and 
beyond: it should be designed for everyone. The opportunity to cycle in our towns and cities 
should be universal. But only the brave will mix with fast-moving traffic on Penny Pot Lane, 
particularly as cyclists are even more vulnerable than usual when riding up steep hills and therefore 
moving more slowly.

Note: hills are less of a problem with the advent of electric bikes, but dedicated bike lanes, with 
physical protection from the traffic, are needed more on uphill sections than on downhill stretches. 
Penny Pot Lane is used by drivers as a through route to avoid congestion on the main roads (A59 
Skipton Road), but it is not suitable to be used for that purpose because it's a narrow lane. One 
solution would be to make it one way for traffic, reduce the speed limit, then widen the footway, 
and install physically protected bike lanes in the uphill directions.

Summary Principle 2: Cycles must be treated as vehicles and not as pedestrians. On urban 
streets, cyclists must be physically separated from pedestrians and should not share space with 
pedestrians.
The shared use pavements on Penny Pot Lane breach this principle. Also, they are 2m70 wide, 
which is below the minimum 3m width specified in Table 6-3. 

Note: shared use pavements on Harlow Moor Road also breach this principle. While pedestrian 
flows are not high there, groups of people walking with buggies and/or dogs often take up the whole 
width of the pavement; quite right too, but it makes the footway unsuitable for cycling. If you go 
and watch you will see that almost no one on a bike uses the pavement. This is a failure of the 
designers to provide usable infrastructure.

The rest of the 'Miller Homes cycleway', the link to Otley Road, is still to be built. I understand the 
design is a shared use pavement on the 'wrong' side of the road for uphill cyclists. If built to that 
design, it will largely be ignored by people on bikes. The design also breaches multiple provisions 
of CID. Is this acceptable to HBC Planning?

Summary Principle 3: Cyclists must be physically separated and protected from high volume 
motor traffic, both at junctions and on the stretches of road between them.
Yet on the main route to/from this development, Penny Pot Lane, cyclists are asked to share the 
road with high volume motor traffic.



Summary Principle 5: Cycle infrastructure should be designed for significant numbers of 
cyclists, and for non-standard cycles. Our aim is that thousands of cyclists a day will use many of  
these schemes.
Penny Pot Lane: the design assumes that everyone will drive, and hardly anyone will cycle – so the 
cycle infrastructure is a sub-standard shared use pavement that doesn't go anywhere.
Killinghall Moor: this is essentially conceived as a leisure route for very occasional use.

Summary Principle 8: Cycle infrastructure must be planned as holistic network; isolated 
stretches of provision are of little value.
Penny Pot Lane: the shared use pavement is an isolated stretch.
Killinghall Moor: you can get to Jennyfield Coop on this route, but the ability to get to a single 
location is not the same thing as a network; a network means you get to most or all local 
destinations on a Coherent, Direct, Safe, Comfortable and Attractive network.

Summary Principle 14: Surfaces must be hard, smooth, level, durable, permeable and safe in all 
weathers.
Killinghall Moor: the path clearly does not meet these requirements.

Summary Principle 19: Schemes must be easy and comfortable to ride. Cycling is a physical 
effort. Schemes should not impose constant stopping and starting.
Penny Pot Lane: the shared use pavement gives way to side roads, so imposes constant stopping and 
starting. Note also that the Jennyfield cycle path gives way to all side roads and therefore imposes 
stopping and starting.

If anyone riding on the road decided to use the shared use pavement from Young's Drive, this would 
also likely involve stopping and starting when crossing the road and getting onto the pavement. In 
reality, almost no cyclists use the shared use pavements typically provided in Harrogate. They are 
not of a standard to attract existing cyclists, and will not attract new cyclists. No more of these 
shared use pavements should be built.

Illustration 3: cyclist rightly ignoring shared use path on Penny Pot Lane (as 
99% do)



Summary Principle 20: All designers of cycle schemes must experience the roads as a cyclist. 
Those who design schemes should travel through the area on a cycle to understand how it feels.
Did this happen?

Summary Principle 21: Avoid inconsistent provision such as a track going from the road to the 
pavement then back to the road, or a track that suddenly vanishes.
This speaks for itself.

Protection from Motor Traffic, para 4.4: 'Motor traffic is the main deterrent to cycling for many 
people with 62% of UK adults feeling that the roads are too unsafe for them to cycle on...The 
need to provide protected space for cycling on highways generally depends on the speed and 
volume of motor traffic. For example, in quiet residential streets, most people will be comfortable  
cycling on the carriageway even though they will be passed by the occasional car moving at low 
speeds'
Penny Pot Lane is not a quiet residential road, and physical protection is needed. Figure 4.1 of CID 
contains a table showing what type of protection is appropriate depending on speed and volume of 
traffic.

Residential access streets can be designed with geometrical layouts that create very low speed 
environments (para.7.5.1). The entrance to the Persimmon Homes development is extremely wide, 
accommodating the fastest possible speeds at entry and exit, and making it more hostile for 
vulnerable road users.



Conclusion and questions
New housing developments are supposed to be an opportunity to improve active travel facilities.

'With appropriate policies and processes in place, most schemes for cycle traffic will be delivered 
alongside other highway works and as part of new developments. There are opportunities to specify 
and enforce the requirement for a good standard of cycle provision to developers and contractors 
through planning briefs, supplementary planning guidance...'(para. 14.1.3).

'The requirements should include the provision of new cycle routes connecting to and through 
developments and enhancing the provision for cycling when making alterations to links and 
junctions and on existing highways. It will not usually be acceptable to maintain an existing poor 
level of service when undertaking highway improvement schemes...' (14.1.4).
Cycling should be put at the heart of the transport network.

This development is on the edge of Harrogate. It could be provided with excellent cycle 
infrastructure, so that cycling would be an attractive option for local journeys.

In fact, no real thought has been given to cycling; there are no improvements to the cycle network; 
current provision breaches multiple provisions of CID; this development as it stands is car-centric 
and will only add to Harrogate's pollution and congestion.

Question 1: Do you agree with my assessment of the development in the context of CID? Are there 
any specific points you disagree with?

Question 2: As you've said that the development will be assessed against CID at the appropriate 
time, will you reject the cycle provision as it stands? And what action will you take?

Best Regards,

David Mitchell

Illustration 4: wide as a canyon...geometry of entrance to Persimmon site



Reply from Elizabeth Sandell, 9th October 2020

Your request has been considered under the Environmental Information Regulations 2004 as we 
consider the subject matter to relate to information that has an effect on the elements of the 
environment.

Condition 26 of the outline permission Ref 14/02737/EIAMAJ states;

‘Details of the footpath/cycleway links, including details of their construction and a timetable of 
implementation, shall be submitted to and approved in writing by the Local Planning Authority 
prior to the occupation of the first dwelling within any phase of the Development that adjoins 
Killinghall Moor Country Park. The links shall be provided in strict accordance with the approved 
details.’

These details have not yet been submitted for approval as this stage of the development has not yet 
begun but we would expect the submitted details to follow the guidance in the Cycle infrastructure 
design (LTN 1/20). There is no reference to this guidance in the original planning reports as it was 
only published in July 2020, after these applications were determined. 

All documents relating to planning applications form part of the planning register and are publically 
accessible on our website by searching on case references or area of interest. This web address is: 
https://uniformonline.harrogate.gov.uk/online-applications/ 

You are also able to create an account and set up alerts so you are notified when applications are 
submitted that meet your criteria.

As a result of the above, we do not hold the information you have requested and it is exempt under 
regulation 12(4)(a) – information not held.

If you are not satisfied with the way your request has been handled, please contact -  

Freedom of Information Officer, PO Box 787, Harrogate, HG1 9RW

or email foi@harrogate.gov.uk

The Council has an internal review procedure.  If your complaint is about the decision which has 
been made you will usually be entitled to have your case reviewed by a senior officer from a 
department which has not been involved in the decision previously. Your request for internal review 
must be received by the Council within 40 working days from the date that the response to your 
initial request is issued.

If, after their decision, you are still not happy, you may appeal to-  

The Information Commissioner

Wycliffe House, Water Lane, Wilmslow, Cheshire SK9 5AF

Tel: 0303 123 1113

website: https://ico.org.uk/

Original letter from David Mitchell, 15th September 2020
15th September 2020
Dear Sirs,
Persimmon Homes development on Penny Pot Lane nr Jubilee 
Roundabout
I would like to know what cycle infrastructure is included in the Persimmon Homes development
currently being built on Penny Pot Lane, and when it will be built. Can you tell me:
1. Where any cycle lanes are to be built (from where to where)? Expected date for completion?

https://uniformonline.harrogate.gov.uk/online-applications/
https://ico.org.uk/
mailto:foi@harrogate.gov.uk


2. What existing cycle infrastructure do they link up to (if any)?
3. What type of cycle infrastructure is it?
4. In terms of physical protection from traffic, does it comply with the requirements set out in
Figure 4.1 (p33) of Cycle Infrastructure Design ('CID') (LTN 1/20)?
5. Does it comply with para 6.1.9 (p51) CID, which states that any reallocation of space should
be from the carriageway, and the level of service for pedestrians should not be reduced?
6. Does it comply with para 6.5.4 (p67) CID, which states that shared use should not be used in
urban areas except as a last resort? Or does one of the situations set out in para 6.5.6 where
shared use might be appropriate, apply?
7. What cycle routes connect to and through the development as required by para 14.1.4
(p154)? Are cycle facilities an essential component of site access and any off-site highway
improvements (para 14.3.12, p156)?
8. Which of the elements in para 14.3.14 (p156) will be included in the Persimmon
development?
Please treat this as a freedom of information request. I look forward to hearing from you.
Yours faithfully,
David Mitchell


